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officer or employee to the charges in said report, 
and, except for those parts thereof which the 
court determines to have been inserted scandal-
ously, prejudiciously, or unnecessarily, such an-
swer shall become an appendix to the report. 

(3) Upon the expiration of the time set forth in 
paragraph (1) of subsection (c) of this section, 
the United States attorney shall deliver a true 
copy of such report, and the appendix, if any, for 
appropriate action to each public officer or body 
having jurisdiction, responsibility, or authority 
over each public officer or employee named in 
the report. 

(d) Upon the submission of a report pursuant 
to subsection (a) of this section, if the court 
finds that the filing of such report as a public 
record may prejudice fair consideration of a 
pending criminal matter, it shall order such re-
port sealed and such report shall not be subject 
to subpena or public inspection during the pend-
ency of such criminal matter, except upon order 
of the court. 

(e) Whenever the court to which a report is 
submitted pursuant to paragraph (1) of sub-
section (a) of this section is not satisfied that 
the report complies with the provisions of sub-
section (b) of this section, it may direct that ad-
ditional testimony be taken before the same 
grand jury, or it shall make an order sealing 
such report, and it shall not be filed as a public 
record or be subject to subpena or otherwise 
made public until the provisions of subsection 
(b) of this section are met. A special grand jury 
term may be extended by the district court be-
yond thirty-six months in order that such addi-
tional testimony may be taken or the provisions 
of subsection (b) of this section may be met. 

(f) As used in this section, ‘‘public officer or 
employee’’ means any officer or employee of the 
United States, any State, the District of Colum-
bia, the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico, any ter-
ritory or possession of the United States, or any 
political subdivision, or any department, agen-
cy, or instrumentality thereof. 

(Added Pub. L. 91–452, title I, § 101(a), Oct. 15, 
1970, 84 Stat. 924.) 

§ 3334. General provisions 

The provisions of chapter 215, title 18, United 
States Code, and the Federal Rules of Criminal 
Procedure applicable to regular grand juries 
shall apply to special grand juries to the extent 
not inconsistent with sections 3331, 3332, or 3333 
of this chapter. 

(Added Pub. L. 91–452, title I, § 101(a), Oct. 15, 
1970, 84 Stat. 926.) 

CHAPTER 217—INDICTMENT AND 
INFORMATION 

Sec. 

3361. Form and contents—Rule. 

3362. Waiver of indictment and prosecution on in-

formation—Rule. 

3363. Joinder of offenses—Rule. 

3364. Joinder of defendants—Rule. 

3365. Amendment of information—Rule. 

3366. Bill of particulars—Rule. 

3367. Dismissal—Rule. 

§ 3361. Form and contents—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Contents and form; striking surplusage, Rule 7(a), (c), 

(d). 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3362. Waiver of indictment and prosecution on 
information—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Waiver of indictment for offenses not punishable by 

death, Rule 7(b). 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3363. Joinder of offenses—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Joinder of two or more offenses in same indictment, 

Rule 8(a). 

Trial together of indictments or informations, Rule 

13. 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3364. Joinder of defendants—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Joinder of two or more defendants charged in same 

indictment, Rule 8(b). 

Relief from prejudicial joinder, Rule 14. 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3365. Amendment of information—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Amendment of information, time and conditions, 

Rule 7(e). 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3366. Bill of particulars—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Bill of particulars for cause; motion after arraign-

ment; time; amendment, Rule 7(f). 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

§ 3367. Dismissal—(Rule) 

SEE FEDERAL RULES OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE 

Dismissal filed by Attorney General or United States 

Attorney, Rule 48. 

Dismissal on objection to array of grand jury or lack 

of legal qualification of individual grand juror, Rule 

6(b)(2). 

(June 25, 1948, ch. 645, 62 Stat. 830.) 

CHAPTER 219—TRIAL BY UNITED STATES 
MAGISTRATE JUDGES 

Sec. 

3401. Misdemeanors; application of probation laws. 

3402. Rules of procedure, practice and appeal. 

AMENDMENTS 

1979—Pub. L. 96–82, § 7(c), Oct. 10, 1979, 93 Stat. 646, 

substituted ‘‘Misdemeanors’’ for ‘‘Minor offenses’’ in 

item 3401. 

1968—Pub. L. 90–578, title III, §§ 301(c), 302(c), Oct. 17, 

1968, 82 Stat. 1115, 1116, substituted ‘‘TRIAL BY 

UNITED STATES MAGISTRATES’’ for ‘‘TRIAL BY 

COMMISSIONERS’’ in chapter heading, and sub-

stituted ‘‘Minor offenses’’ for ‘‘Petty offenses’’ and 

struck out ‘‘fees’’ after ‘‘probation laws’’ in item 3401. 
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