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§ 3006. Civil action 

(a) Parties; remedies 

The host State, the host racing association, or 
the horsemen’s group may commence a civil ac-
tion against any person alleged to be in viola-
tion of this chapter, for injunctive relief to re-
strain violations and for damages in accordance 
with section 3005 of this title. 

(b) Intervention 

In any civil action under this section, the host 
State, the host racing association and horse-
men’s group, if not a party, shall be permitted 
to intervene as a matter of right. 

(c) Limitations 

A civil action may not be commenced pursu-
ant to this section more than 3 years after the 
discovery of the alleged violation upon which 
such civil action is based. 

(d) State as defendant 

Nothing in this chapter shall be construed to 
permit a State to be sued under this section 
other than in accordance with its applicable 
laws. 

(Pub. L. 95–515, § 7, Oct. 25, 1978, 92 Stat. 1814.) 

§ 3007. Jurisdiction and venue 

(a) District court jurisdiction 

Notwithstanding any other provision of law, 
the district courts of the United States shall 
have jurisdiction over any civil action under 
this chapter, without regard to the citizenship 
of the parties or the amount in controversy. 

(b) Venue; service of process 

A civil action under this chapter may be 
brought in any district court of the United 
States for a district located in the host State or 
the off-track State, and all process in any such 
civil action may be served in any judicial dis-
trict of the United States. 

(c) Concurrent State court jurisdiction 

The jurisdiction of the district courts of the 
United States pursuant to this section shall be 
concurrent with that of any State court of com-
petent jurisdiction located in the host State or 
the off-track State. 

(Pub. L. 95–515, § 8, Oct. 25, 1978, 92 Stat. 1814.) 
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§ 3101. Congressional findings 

(a) The Congress finds that the Nation has suf-
fered substantial unemployment and under-
employment, idleness of other productive re-
sources, high rates of inflation, and inadequate 
productivity growth, over prolonged periods of 
time, imposing numerous economic and social 
costs on the Nation. Such costs include the fol-
lowing: 

(1) The Nation is deprived of the full supply 
of goods and services, the full utilization of 
labor and capital resources, and the related in-
creases in economic well-being that would 
occur under conditions of genuine full employ-
ment, production, and real income, balanced 
growth, a balanced Federal budget, and the ef-
fective control of inflation. 

(2) The output of goods and services is insuf-
ficient to meet pressing national priorities. 

(3) Workers are deprived of the job security, 
income, skill development, and productivity 
necessary to maintain and advance their 
standards of living. 

(4) Business and industry are deprived of the 
production, sales, capital flow, and productiv-
ity necessary to maintain adequate profits, 
undertake new investment, create jobs, com-
pete internationally, and contribute to meet-
ing society’s economic needs. These problems 
are especially acute for smaller businesses. 
Variations in the business cycle and low-level 
operations of the economy are far more dam-
aging to smaller businesses than to larger 
business concerns because smaller businesses 
have fewer available resources, and less access 
to resources, to withstand nationwide eco-
nomic adversity. A decline in small business 
enterprises contributes to unemployment by 
reducing employment opportunities and con-
tributes to inflation by reducing competition. 

(5) Unemployment exposes many families to 
social, psychological, and physiological costs, 
including disruption of family life, loss of indi-
vidual dignity and self-respect, and the aggra-
vation of physical and psychological illnesses, 
alcoholism and drug abuse, crime, and social 
conflicts. 

(6) Federal, State, and local government 
budgets are undermined by deficits due to 
shortfalls in tax revenues and in increases in 
expenditures for unemployment compensation, 
public assistance, and other recession-related 
services in the areas of criminal justice, alco-
holism and drug abuse, and physical and men-
tal health. 

(b) The Congress further finds that: 
(1) High unemployment may contribute to 

inflation by diminishing labor training and 
skills, underutilizing capital resources, reduc-
ing the rate of productivity advance, increas-
ing unit labor costs, and reducing the general 
supply of goods and services. 

(2) Aggregate monetary and fiscal policies 
alone have been unable to achieve full employ-


		Superintendent of Documents
	2016-08-26T10:07:38-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




