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‘‘Museum of African Art’’ (hereinafter in this 
subchapter referred to as the ‘‘Museum’’). The 
functions of such bureau shall be those author-
ized by section 80m(a) of this title. 

(Pub. L. 95–414, § 2, Oct. 5, 1978, 92 Stat. 911.) 

CONSTRUCTION OF NATIONAL MUSEUM OF AFRICAN ART 

Regents of Smithsonian Institution authorized to 
construct building for National Museum of African Art, 
see Pub. L. 97–203, June 24, 1982, 96 Stat. 129, set out as 
a note under section 50 of this title. 

§ 80m. Powers of Board 

(a) Acquisition, retention, and disposition of 
property; research and education programs 

For the purpose of carrying out sections 80k 
and 80l of this title, the Board may— 

(1) purchase, accept, borrow, or otherwise ac-
quire additional works of art or any other real 
or personal property for the Museum; 

(2) preserve, maintain, restore, display, loan, 
transfer, store, or otherwise hold any property 
of whatsoever nature acquired pursuant to sec-
tion 80k of this title or paragraph (1) of this 
subsection; 

(3) conduct programs of research and edu-
cation; and 

(4) subject to any limitations otherwise ex-
pressly provided by law, and, in the case of 
any gift, subject to any applicable restrictions 
under the terms of such gift, sell, exchange, or 
otherwise dispose of any property of whatso-
ever nature acquired pursuant to the provi-
sions of this subchapter: Provided, That the 
proceeds from the sale of any property ac-
quired pursuant to section 80k of this title 
shall be designated for the benefit of the Mu-
seum. 

(b) Recommendations of Commission 

In carrying out the purposes of this sub-
chapter, the Board shall consider the recom-
mendations of the Commission established pur-
suant to section 80n of this title. 

(Pub. L. 95–414, § 3, Oct. 5, 1978, 92 Stat. 911.) 

§ 80n. Commission for the Museum of African Art 

(a) Establishment; duties 

There is established a Commission for the Mu-
seum of African Art (hereinafter the ‘‘Commis-
sion’’) which shall provide advice and assistance 
to the Board concerning the operation and de-
velopment of the Museum, its collections and 
programs. 

(b) Membership 

The Commission shall consist of fifteen mem-
bers to be appointed by the Board. In addition, 
the Secretary and an Assistant Secretary of the 
Smithsonian Institution shall serve as ex officio 
members. The Board shall appoint to the first 
term on the Commission no less than ten mem-
bers of the Board of Trustees of the Museum of 
African Art who are serving on October 5, 1978. 
Each initial member so appointed shall serve for 
a three-year term. Thereafter, in appointing 
members of the Commission the Board shall 
continue to include representatives of African 
descendants in the United States, collectors of 
African Art, and scholars in the fields of African 
art and culture. 

(c) Terms of office 

Members of the Commission shall be appointed 
to serve for a three-year term, except that after 
the appointment of the first term of the Com-
mission as specified in subsection (b) of this sec-
tion, the terms of office of members next ap-
pointed shall expire, as designated by the Board 
at the time of appointment, one-third at the end 
of one year, one-third at the end of two years, 
and one-third at the end of three years. Any 
member appointed to fill a vacancy occurring 
prior to the expiration of the term for which his 
predecessor was appointed shall be appointed for 
the remainder of such term. Members may be re-
appointed. 

(d) Quorum; vacancies 

A majority of the appointed members of the 
Commission shall constitute a quorum and any 
vacancy in the Commission shall not affect its 
power to function. 

(e) Travel, subsistence, and other expenses 

Members of the Commission shall be reim-
bursed for travel, subsistence, and other nec-
essary expenses incurred by them in the per-
formance of their duties. 

(f) Selection of officers; bylaws 

The Commission shall select officers, from 
among its members biennially and shall make 
bylaws to carry out its functions under this sub-
chapter. 

(Pub. L. 95–414, § 4, Oct. 5, 1978, 92 Stat. 911.) 

§ 80o. Director, officers, and employees; appoint-
ment, compensation, and duties 

The Board may appoint and fix the compensa-
tion and duties of the Director and such other 
officers and employees of the Museum as may be 
necessary for the efficient administration, oper-
ation, and maintenance of the Museum; the Di-
rector and two other employees of the Museum 
may be appointed and compensated without re-
gard to the provisions of title 5 governing ap-
pointments in the competitive service and chap-
ter 51 and subchapter III of chapter 53 of title 5; 
and all of the employees of the Museum who are 
serving on the date of the transfer authorized 
under section 80k of this title shall be offered 
employment by the Smithsonian under its usual 
terms of employment and may be appointed 
without regard to the provisions of title 5 gov-
erning appointments in the competitive service 
and chapter 51 and subchapter III of chapter 53 
of title 5. 

(Pub. L. 95–414, § 5, Oct. 5, 1978, 92 Stat. 912.) 

§ 80p. Funding 

(a) Federal funds for Museum 

The faith of the United States is pledged that 
upon the completion of the acquisition in sec-
tion 80k of this title, the United States will pro-
vide such funds as may be necessary for the up-
keep of the Museum and the administrative ex-
penses and costs of operation thereof, including 
the protection and care of works of art acquired 
by the Board, so the Museum shall at all times 
be properly maintained and works of art con-
tained therein shall be exhibited regularly to 
the general public free of charge. 
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