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and for treatment of related references, see sections 

468(b), 551(d), 552(d), and 557 of Title 6, Domestic Secu-

rity, and the Department of Homeland Security Reor-

ganization Plan of November 25, 2002, as modified, set 

out as a note under section 542 of Title 6. 

§ 3317. Fees 

(a) The Secretary may prescribe by regulation 
fees for inspecting or examining a small pas-
senger vessel or a sailing school vessel. 

(b) When an inspection or examination under 
this part of a documented vessel or a foreign 
vessel is conducted at a foreign port or place at 
the request of the owner or managing operator 
of the vessel, the owner or operator shall reim-
burse the Secretary for the travel and subsist-
ence expenses incurred by the personnel as-
signed to perform the inspection or examina-
tion. Amounts received as reimbursement for 
these expenses shall be credited to the appro-
priation for operating expenses of the Coast 
Guard. 

(Pub. L. 98–89, Aug. 26, 1983, 97 Stat. 517; Pub. L. 
102–587, title V, § 5211, Nov. 4, 1992, 106 Stat. 5076.) 

HISTORICAL AND REVISION NOTES 

Revised section Source section (U.S. Code) 

3317 .............................................. 46:390a(b) 
46:382b–1 

Section 3317 provides the regulatory authority for 

prescribing fees for the inspection of small passenger 

vessels and sailing school vessels. Although section 2110 

generally prohibits fees of this nature, this provision is 

consistent with the exception that permits specific 

statutory authorization for fee collection. Subsection 

(b) requires the reimbursement of expenses for the con-

duct of an inspection or examination at a foreign port 

or place when done there for the convenience of the 

owner or operator of the vessel. 

AMENDMENTS 

1992—Subsec. (b). Pub. L. 102–587 substituted ‘‘under 

this part of a documented vessel or a foreign vessel’’ for 

‘‘under this chapter of a documented vessel’’. 

TRANSFER OF FUNCTIONS 

For transfer of authorities, functions, personnel, and 

assets of the Coast Guard, including the authorities 

and functions of the Secretary of Transportation relat-

ing thereto, to the Department of Homeland Security, 

and for treatment of related references, see sections 

468(b), 551(d), 552(d), and 557 of Title 6, Domestic Secu-

rity, and the Department of Homeland Security Reor-

ganization Plan of November 25, 2002, as modified, set 

out as a note under section 542 of Title 6. 

§ 3318. Penalties 

(a) Except as otherwise provided in this part, 
the owner, charterer, managing operator, agent, 
master, or individual in charge of a vessel oper-
ated in violation of this part or a regulation pre-
scribed under this part, and a person violating a 
regulation that applies to a small passenger ves-
sel, freight vessel of less than 100 gross tons as 
measured under section 14502 of this title, or an 
alternate tonnage measured under section 14302 
of this title as prescribed by the Secretary under 
section 14104 of this title, or sailing school ves-
sel, are liable to the United States Government 
for a civil penalty of not more than $5,000. The 
vessel also is liable in rem for the penalty. 

(b)(1) A person that knowingly manufactures, 
sells, offers for sale, or possesses with intent to 

sell, any equipment subject to this part, and the 
equipment is so defective as to be insufficient to 
accomplish the purpose for which it is intended, 
commits a class D felony. 

(2) A person commits a class D felony if the 
person— 

(A) alters or services lifesaving, fire safety, 
or any other equipment subject to this part for 
compensation; and 

(B) by that alteration or servicing, inten-
tionally renders that equipment unsafe and 
unfit for the purpose for which it is intended. 

(c) A person that employs a means or device 
whereby a boiler may be subjected to a pressure 
greater than allowed by the terms of the vessel’s 
certificate of inspection commits a class D fel-
ony. 

(d) A person that deranges or hinders the oper-
ation of any machinery or device employed on a 
vessel to denote the state of steam or water in 
any boiler or to give warning of approaching 
danger, or permits the water level of any boiler 
when in operation of a vessel to fall below its 
prescribed low-water line, commits a class D fel-
ony. 

(e) A person that alters, defaces, obliterates, 
removes, or destroys any plans or specifications 
required by and approved under a regulation 
prescribed under section 3306 of this title, with 
intent to deceive or impede any official of the 
United States in carrying out that official’s du-
ties, commits a class A misdemeanor. 

(f) A person commits a class D felony if the 
person— 

(1) forges or counterfeits with intent to 
make it appear genuine any mark or stamp 
prescribed for material to be tested and ap-
proved under section 3306 of this title or a reg-
ulation prescribed under section 3306; 

(2) knowingly uses, affixes, or causes to be 
used or affixed, any such forged or counter-
feited mark or stamp to or on material of any 
description; 

(3) with fraudulent intent, possesses any 
such mark, stamp, or other device knowing it 
to be forged or counterfeited; or 

(4) with fraudulent intent, marks or causes 
to be marked with the trademark or name of 
another, material required to be tested and ap-
proved under section 3306 of this title or a reg-
ulation prescribed under section 3306. 

(g) A person is liable to the Government for a 
civil penalty of not more than $5,000, if the per-
son— 

(1) interferes with the inspection of a nau-
tical school vessel; 

(2) violates a regulation prescribed for a nau-
tical school vessel; 

(3) is an owner of a nautical school vessel op-
erated in violation of this part; or 

(4) is an officer or member of the board of di-
rectors of a school, organization, association, 
partnership, or corporation owning a nautical 
school vessel operated in violation of a regula-
tion prescribed for a nautical school vessel. 

(h) An owner, charterer, managing operator, 
agent, master, or individual in charge of a vessel 
that fails to give the notice required by section 
3304(b) of this title is liable to the Government 
for a civil penalty of not more than $1,000. The 
vessel also is liable in rem for the penalty. 
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