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(Pub. L. 100–697, § 3, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4614.) 

REFERENCES IN TEXT 

The National Critical Materials Act of 1984, referred 

to in subsec. (d), is title II of Pub. L. 98–373, July 31, 

1984, 98 Stat. 1248, as amended, which is classified gen-

erally to chapter 30 (§ 1801 et seq.) of Title 30, Mineral 

Lands and Mining. For complete classification of this 

Act to the Code, see Short Title note set out under sec-

tion 1801 of Title 30 and Tables. 

§ 5203. Department of Energy 

The Secretary of Energy shall conduct a pro-
gram in superconductivity research and develop-
ment. Within 180 days after November 19, 1988, 
and for the two succeeding years thereafter, the 
Secretary shall submit annual reports on the 
implementation of technology transfer activi-
ties under the Stevenson-Wydler Technology In-
novation Act of 1980 [15 U.S.C. 3701 et seq.] and 
related legislation with respect to superconduc-
tivity research and development to the Commit-
tee on Science, Space, and Technology of the 
House of Representatives and to the Committee 
on Energy and Natural Resources of the Senate. 
Such report shall include recommendations for 
improvements in the technology transfer be-
tween government and industry, and in the man-
agement of property developed or made at the 
National Laboratories. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 4, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4615.) 

REFERENCES IN TEXT 

The Stevenson-Wydler Technology Innovation Act of 

1980, referred to in text, is Pub. L. 96–480, Oct. 21, 1980, 

94 Stat. 2311, as amended, which is classified generally 

to chapter 63 (§ 3701 et seq.) of this title. For complete 

classification of this Act to the Code, see Short Title 

note set out under section 3701 of this title and Tables. 

§ 5204. National Institute of Standards and Tech-
nology 

In pursuance of the goals of this chapter, the 
National Institute of Standards and Technology 
shall promote fundamental research and mate-
rials standards to accelerate the use and appli-
cation of the new superconducting materials, 
and shall utilize the Superconductivity Center 
Focusing on Electronic Applications at the Na-
tional Institute of Standards and Technology in 
Boulder, Colorado. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 5, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4615.) 

§ 5205. National Science Foundation 

The National Science Foundation shall pro-
mote fundamental research in pursuance of the 
goals of this chapter. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 6, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4615.) 

§ 5206. National Aeronautics and Space Adminis-
tration 

The National Aeronautics and Space Adminis-
tration shall utilize existing programs in tech-
nology transfer, aeronautics and space tech-
nology, and space commercialization to promote 
the commercial applications of high-tempera-
ture superconductors, including applications re-
lating to thin film technology, communications 
technology, sensors, space power, and propul-
sion. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 7, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4615.) 

§ 5207. Department of Defense 

(a) Focus of research 

In conformance with the Superconductivity 
Action Plan, the Secretary of Defense, in the 
superconductivity research and development ac-
tivities of the Department of Defense, shall give 
emphasis to fundamental research, materials 
processing, and applications of new super-
conducting materials. 

(b) Additional activities 

In conducting research under subsection (a), 
the Secretary of Defense shall— 

(1) systematically define the engineering pa-
rameters for high-temperature super-
conducting materials; and 

(2) conduct the necessary development, engi-
neering, and operational prototype testing 
considered appropriate to the overall mission 
of the Department of Defense. Such oper-
ational prototype testing shall, where appro-
priate, utilize criteria developed by the De-
fense Advanced Research Projects Agency. 

(c) Defense Advanced Research Projects Agency 

The Director of the Defense Advanced Re-
search Projects Agency shall, in conformance 
with the Superconductivity Action Plan, con-
duct activities to— 

(1) augment, as appropriate, basic and ap-
plied superconductivity research conducted in 
other Federal agencies and industry; and 

(2) develop criteria for operational prototype 
testing within the Department of Defense. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 8, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4615.) 

§ 5208. International cooperation 

The President, as part of the Superconduc-
tivity Action Plan, shall establish a program of 
international cooperation in the conduct of fun-
damental and basic research on superconducting 
materials. Such program of international co-
operation shall include the exchange of basic in-
formation and data, as well as the development 
of international standards for the use and appli-
cation of superconducting materials. 

(Pub. L. 100–697, § 9, Nov. 19, 1988, 102 Stat. 4616.) 

§ 5209. Technology transfer 

(a) Promotion 

In pursuance of the goals of this chapter, all 
Federal departments and agencies shall conduct 
technology transfer activities as appropriate to 
the overall mission of each department or agen-
cy to— 

(1) complement basic superconductivity re-
search by promoting the rapid development of 
manufacturing and processing technologies 
necessary for the commercialization of high- 
temperature superconductors; and 

(2) promote collaborative arrangements and 
consortia of industry (which shall include 
small business) in order to lower the barriers 
to deployment of advanced high-temperature 
superconductor technology; such consortia to 
also include, as appropriate, universities and 
independent research organizations. 


		Superintendent of Documents
	2019-10-15T21:14:42-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




