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(1) The United States and Foreign Commer-
cial Service (hereafter in this section referred 
to as the ‘‘Commercial Service’’) plays an im-
portant role in helping United States busi-
nesses identify export opportunities and de-
velop reliable sources of information on com-
mercial prospects in foreign countries. 

(2) During the 1980s, the presence of the 
Commercial Service in sub-Saharan Africa 
consisted of 14 professionals providing services 
in eight countries. By early 1997, that presence 
had been reduced by half to seven profes-
sionals in only four countries. 

(3) Since 1997, the Department of Commerce 
has slowly begun to increase the presence of 
the Commercial Service in sub-Saharan Afri-
ca, adding five full-time officers to established 
posts. 

(4) Although the Commercial Service Offi-
cers in these countries have regional respon-
sibilities, this kind of coverage does not ade-
quately service the needs of United States 
businesses attempting to do business in sub- 
Saharan Africa. 

(5) The Congress has, on several occasions, 
encouraged the Commercial Service to focus 
its resources and efforts in countries or re-
gions in Europe or Asia to promote greater 
United States export activity in those mar-
kets, and similar encouragement should be 
provided for countries in sub-Saharan Africa 
as well. 

(6) Because market information is not wide-
ly available in many sub-Saharan African 
countries, the presence of additional Commer-
cial Service Officers and resources can play a 
significant role in assisting United States 
businesses in markets in those countries. 

(b) Appointments 

Subject to the availability of appropriations, 
by not later than December 31, 2001, the Sec-
retary of Commerce, acting through the Assist-
ant Secretary of Commerce and Director Gen-
eral of the United States and Foreign Commer-
cial Service, shall take steps to ensure that— 

(1) at least 20 full-time Commercial Service 
employees are stationed in sub-Saharan Afri-
ca; and 

(2) full-time Commercial Service employees 
are stationed in not less than 10 different sub- 
Saharan African countries. 

(c) Initiative for sub-Saharan Africa 

In order to encourage the export of United 
States goods and services to sub-Saharan Afri-
can countries, the International Trade Adminis-
tration shall make a special effort to— 

(1) identify United States goods and services 
which are the best prospects for export by 
United States companies to sub-Saharan Afri-
ca; 

(2) identify, where appropriate, tariff and 
nontariff barriers that are preventing or hin-
dering sales of United States goods and serv-
ices to, or the operation of United States com-
panies in, sub-Saharan Africa; 

(3) hold discussions with appropriate au-
thorities in sub-Saharan Africa on the matters 
described in paragraphs (1) and (2) with a view 
to securing increased market access for United 
States exporters of goods and services; 

(4) identify current resource allocations and 
personnel levels in sub-Saharan Africa for the 
Commercial Service and consider plans for the 
deployment of additional resources or person-
nel to that region; and 

(5) make available to the public, through 
printed and electronic means of communica-
tion, the information derived pursuant to 
paragraphs (1) through (4) for each of the 4 
years after May 18, 2000. 

(Pub. L. 106–200, title I, § 125, May 18, 2000, 114 
Stat. 270.) 

§ 3736. Donation of air traffic control equipment 
to eligible sub-Saharan African countries 

It is the sense of the Congress that, to the ex-
tent appropriate, the United States Government 
should make every effort to donate to govern-
ments of sub-Saharan African countries deter-
mined to be eligible under section 3703 of this 
title air traffic control equipment that is no 
longer in use, including appropriate related 
reimbursable technical assistance. 

(Pub. L. 106–200, title I, § 126, May 18, 2000, 114 
Stat. 271.) 

§ 3737. Additional authorities and increased flexi-
bility to provide assistance under the Devel-
opment Fund for Africa 

(a) Use of sustainable development assistance to 
support further economic growth 

It is the sense of the Congress that sustained 
economic growth in sub-Saharan Africa depends 
in large measure upon the development of a re-
ceptive environment for trade and investment, 
and that to achieve this objective the United 
States Agency for International Development 
should continue to support programs which help 
to create this environment. Investments in 
human resources, development, and implemen-
tation of free market policies, including policies 
to liberalize agricultural markets and improve 
food security, and the support for the rule of law 
and democratic governance should continue to 
be encouraged and enhanced on a bilateral and 
regional basis. 

(b) Declarations of policy 

The Congress makes the following declara-
tions: 

(1) The Development Fund for Africa estab-
lished under chapter 10 of part I of the Foreign 
Assistance Act of 1961 (22 U.S.C. 2293 et seq.) 
has been an effective tool in providing devel-
opment assistance to sub-Saharan Africa since 
1988. 

(2) The Development Fund for Africa will 
complement the other provisions of this chap-
ter and lay a foundation for increased trade 
and investment opportunities between the 
United States and sub-Saharan Africa. 

(3) Assistance provided through the Develop-
ment Fund for Africa will continue to support 
programs and activities that promote the long 
term economic development of sub-Saharan 
Africa, such as programs and activities relat-
ing to the following: 

(A) Strengthening primary and vocational 
education systems, especially the acquisi-
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